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MATTHEW 15:21-28

[21] And Jesus went away from there and withdrew to 
the district of Tyre and Sidon. [22] And behold, a 
Canaanite woman from that region came out and was 
crying, “Have mercy on me, O Lord, Son of David; my 
daughter is severely oppressed by a demon.” [23] But 
he did not answer her a word. And his disciples came 
and begged him, saying, “Send her away, for she is 
crying out after us.” 



[24] He answered, “I was sent only to the lost sheep 
of the house of Israel.” [25] But she came and knelt 
before him, saying, “Lord, help me.” [26] And he 
answered, “It is not right to take the children's bread 
and throw it to the dogs.” [27] She said, “Yes, Lord, 
yet even the dogs eat the crumbs that fall from their 
masters' table.” [28] Then Jesus answered her, “O 
woman, great is your faith! Be it done for you as you 
desire.” And her daughter was healed instantly.   
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I. HIS SILENCE

Matthew 15:21–23 

[21] And Jesus went away from there and withdrew to 
the district of Tyre and Sidon. [22] And behold, a 
Canaanite woman from that region came out and was 
crying, “Have mercy on me, O Lord, Son of David; my 
daughter is severely oppressed by a demon.” [23] 
But he did not answer her a word.  





PSALM 13:1-2

[1] How long, O LORD? Will you forget me forever?  
        How long will you hide your face from me?  
    [2] How long must I take counsel in my soul  
        and have sorrow in my heart all the day?  
    How long shall my enemy be exalted over me?   













II. HIS TRUTHS

And his disciples came and begged him, saying, 
“Send her away, for she is crying out after us.” [24] He 
answered, “I was sent only to the lost sheep of the 
house of Israel.” [25] But she came and knelt before 
him, saying, “Lord, help me.” [26] And he answered, 
“It is not right to take the children's bread and throw it 
to the dogs.”  



[27] She said, “Yes, Lord, yet even the dogs eat the 
crumbs that fall from their masters' table.”  



GENESIS 12:3

[3] I will bless those who bless you, and him who 
dishonors you I will curse, and in you all the families 
of the earth shall be blessed.” 



ISAIAH 49:6
[6] he says: 

 “It is too light a thing that you should be my servant 

  to raise up the tribes of Jacob 

  and to bring back the preserved of Israel; 

 I will make you as a light for the nations, 

  that my salvation may reach to the end of the earth.” 



1 JOHN 3:1 

[1] See what kind of love the Father has given to us, 
that we should be called children of God; and so we 
are.   

His Truth encountered my deepest grief to give my 
deepest joy.   



PSALM 139:13-14

[13] For you formed my inward parts;  
        you knitted me together in my mother's womb.  
    [14] I praise you, for I am fearfully and wonderfully made.  
    Wonderful are your works;  
        my soul knows it very well.   



III. HIS END 

28] Then Jesus answered her, “O woman, great is 
your faith! Be it done for you as you desire.” And her 
daughter was healed instantly. 



REVELATION 22:3-5

“No longer will there be anything accursed, but the 
throne of God and of the Lamb will be in it, and his 
servants will worship him. They will see his face, and 
his name will be on their foreheads. And night will be 
no more. They will need no light of lamp or sun, for 
the Lord God will be their light, and they will reign 
forever and ever.”  
  




